LOC
12/15/05
Item No. 13

101825

ACCEPTING A LOW RESPONSIVE BID SUBMITTED BY SANTEX
TRUCK CENTERS LTD., BID NO. 1, TO PROVIDE THE
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT WITH 10
REPLACEMENT RECYCLE COLLECTION TRUCKS TO BE UTILIZED
IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE CITY RECYCLING PROGRAM FOR A
TOTAL OF $1,765,790.00, FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND
REPLACEMENT FUND.

AN ORDINANCE

*® * * % %

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio Environmental Services
Department with ten waste recycling collection trucks; and

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Grande Truck Center, Bid Nos. 1 and 2 did not meet City
specifications; and

WHEREAS, the low responsive bid was submitted by Santex Truck Centers Ltd., Bid No. 1, for a
total cost of $1,765,790.00; and

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code indicates that competitive bidding is not required
under section 252.022(a)(2) for procurements which are necessary to preserve or protect the public
health or safety of the municipality’s residents; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The low, responsive bid submitted by Santex Truck Centers Ltd., Bid No. 1, for a
total cost of $1,765,790.00, is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all
required bonds, performance deposits and insurance certificates. The bid and bid tabulation sheet
are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit A.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bids submitted Grande Truck Center, Bid
Nos. 1 and 2 did not meet City specifications.

SECTION 3. It has also been found that garbage collection, by its nature, involves the health and
safety of the City’s residents, and that, therefore, competitive bidding is not required pursuant to
Texas Local Government Code 252.022(a)(2) for procurements which are necessary to preserve or
protect the public health or safety of the municipality’s residents.

SECTION 4. The amount of $1,765,790.00 is authorized to be encumbered in Fund 72-001000,
Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund, upon issuance of a purchase order, and payment is
authorized to Santex Truck Centers Ltd., for the purchase of 10 replacement recycle collection
trucks. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 2005-2006 budget approved by City
Council.




SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this Ordinance are subject to approval by the Director of
Finance for the City of San Antonio. The Director may, subject to concurrence by the City
Manager, or her designee, correct allocations to specific Cost Centers and Fund Numbers as
necessary to carry out the purpose of this Ordinance.

SECTION 6. This ordinance shall take effect December 25, 2005.

PASSED AND APPROVED on December 15, 2005.

ATTEST: Lm'll %- I@/ PHIL HARDBERGER

City Cler

APPROVED AS TO FORM:; !
City Attorney




City of San Ant....0 Bid Tabulation

MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
Opened: July 15, 2005 Bid # 1 Bid # 1 Bid#2 Bid#3 Bid # 4 Bid#5
For: Recycle Collection Trucks Santex Truck Centers 1Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center
Ltd
05-096 TC 1380 Ackerman Rd. PO Box 201210 PO Box 201210 PO Box 201210 PO Box 201210 PO Box 201210
San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio
Item Description Quantity [TX 78219 TX 78220 TX 78220 TX 78220 TX 78220 TX 78220
1 |Deleted
Optionai:
1A |Recycle Collection Truck, 31+ Cubic Yard,

High Compaction, Side Load, Tilt To Dump 10 NAS NAS
Price per Each $183,579.004 No Bid $181,020.00 $175,610.00 $192,670.00) $193,215.00
Price Total $1,835,790.00 $1,810,200.00 $1,756,100.00 $1,926,700.00 $1,932,150.00,
Less Trade in - Unit #4810 $3,500.008 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00] $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4814 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00) $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4817 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00] $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4819 $3,500.004 $4,500.00 $4,500.00, $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4820 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00] $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4821 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00| $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4822 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4824 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4825 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4827 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00; $4,500.00 $4,500.00]
Less Trade In - Unit #4829 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00! $4,500.00 $4,500.00]
Less Trade In - Unit #4835 $3,500.00¢ $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4811 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade in - Unit #4815 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00|
Less Trade In - Unit #4826 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4836 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4800 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00)
Less Trade In - Unit #4816 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4846 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00] $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4848 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Total Trade Ins $70,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00
Price Total Less Trade-Ins $1,765,790.00 $1,720,200.00 $1 ,666,‘i00.00 $1,836,700.00] $1,842,150.00
Make Crane Carriel Auto Car Auto Carl Auto Car Auto Car
Model LDT2-46 WXLL WXLL64 wXxe4lLL WXLL
Body McNeilus! McNeilus Bridgeport Labrie Heil
Delivery 210 Days| 210 Days 210 Days 210 Days 210 Days 210 Days
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total Award $1,765,790.00]

NAS: Grande Truck Center, Bid #2 and Bid #3 - did not meet bid specifications.
Cab area was too small for the average City employee operating the equipment;
thus, posing potentiai safety hazards to citizens and City employees.
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City of San Ant....0 Bid Tabulation

MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
Opened: July 15, 2005 Bid # 1 Bid#2 Bid # 3 Bid # 2
For: Recycle Collection Trucks Rush Truck Center Rush Truck Center Rush Truck Center Santex Truck Centers
Ltd
05-096 TC PO Box 200105 PO Box 200105 PO Box 200105 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio
Item Description Quantity |[TX 78220 TX 78220 TX 78220 TX 78219
1 |Deleted
Optional:
1A |Recycle Collection Truck, 31+ Cubic Yard, )

High Compaction, Side Load, Tilt To Dump 10
Price per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $195,734.00
Price Total $1,957,340.00]
Less Trade In - Unit #4810 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4814 $3,500.00]
Less Trade In - Unit #4817 $3,500.00]
Less Trade In - Unit #4819 $3,500.00]
Less Trade In - Unit #4820 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4821 $3,500.00;
Less Trade in - Unit #4822 $3,500.00;
Less Trade In - Unit #4824 $3,500.00|
Less Trade In - Unit #4825 $3,500.00]
Less Trade In - Unit #4827 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4829 $3,500.00
Less Trade in - Unit #4835 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4811 $3,500.00]
Less Trade In - Unit #4815 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4826 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4836 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4800 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4816 $3,500.00)
Less Trade In - Unit #4846 $3,500.00
Less Trade In - Unit #4848 $3,500.00
Total Trade Ins $70,000.00;
Price Total Less Trade-Ins $1,887,340.00
Make Crane Carrier]
Model LDT2-46
Body Heil
Delivery 110 Days 110 Days 110 Days 210 Days
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total Award

NAS: Grande Truck Center, Bid #2 and Bid #3 - did not meet bid specifications.
Cab area was too small for the average City employee operating the eguipment;
thus, posing potential safety hazards to citizens and City empioyees.
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