
11/01/07 
Item No. 10 

ANORDINANCE 2007-11-01-1136 
ACCEPTING THE BIDS OF VAFUOUS COMPANIES TO PROVIDE 
THE CITY WITH VARIOUS TYPES OF COMMODITIES AND 
SERVICES ON AN ANNUAL CONTRACT BASIS FOR FY 2007-2008 
FOR A COMBINED ESTIMATED COST OF $9,395,680.00, INCLUDING: 
(A) BLACK SOIL; (B) ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE FOR PARKING 
GARAGES; (C) EMERGENCY VEHICLE TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE; 
(D) ARTS & CRAFTS SUPPLIES; (E) LAWN MAINTENANCE FOR 
SERVICE CENTERS; (F) RECREATIONAL BOARD & TABLE GAMES; 
(G) COMMUNICATIONS & DATA INFRASTRUCTURE; (H) 
ETHERNET TO SERIAL CARDS FOR THE TRAFFIC 
CONTROLLERS; (I) WORK UNIFORM RENTAL & LAUNDRY 
SERVICE; AND (J) JANITORIAL, SUPPLEMENTAL 
CONVERSIONLABOR, AND RIGGING SERVICES AT THE 
ALAMODOME. 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, this group of contracts represents a portion of approximately two hundred and fifty 
(250) annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout the remainder of the 
fiscal year; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from various companies to furnish the City with: black soil; elevator 
maintenance for parking garages; emergency vehicle truck parts & service; arts & crafts 
supplies; lawn maintenance for service centers; recreational board & table games; 
communications & data infrastructure; Ethernet to serial cards for the traffic controllers; work 
uniform rental & laundry service; and janitorial, supplemental conversion/labor, and rigging 
services at the Alarnodome; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves 7 low bid contracts, 4 contracts procured utilizing 
cooperative purchasing, 1 best value bid contract, 4 contracts in which awards were 
recommended to other than the low bidder because the low bidder failed to meet the City's 
specifications andlor requirements; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the 2007-2008 budget approved by City 
Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids of various companies to furnish the City with: black soil; elevator 
maintenance for parking garages; emergency vehicle truck parts & service; arts & crafts 
supplies; lawn maintenance for service centers; recreational board & table games; 



communications & data infrastructure; Ethernet to serial cards for the traffic controllers; work 
uniform rental & laundry service; and janitorial, supplemental conversion~labor, and rigging 
services at the Alamodome are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all 
required bonds, performance deposits and insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid 
tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes-as Exhibit I. Copies 
of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing and Contract Services 
Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bid of the following company failed to 
meet the City's specifications, as shown on the attached bid tabulations: Karnico Instructional 
Media for recreational board and table games. 

SECTION 3. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and 
payment is authorized to various vendors. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 
2007-2008 budget approved by City Council. The combined estimated total for contracts listed 
on this ordinance is approximately $9,395,680.00. 

SECTION 4. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director may, subject to concurrence by the City Manager 
or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific cost centers and fund numbers as 
necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 5. This ordinance shall take effect November 11,2007, 

PASSED and APPROVED this lSC day of November, 2007. 

ATTEST: c&15*& 
city C@ 

1 



ANNU& CONTRACT TABLE OF CONTENTS RFCA # 2381 

November 1,2007 

COMMODITY MBErWBE VENDOR 

Contracts procured on the basis of low bids: i 
I 

A. Black Soil MBE Casares Sand Pit & Trucking 
A291 -08-JM Entire Bid 
Upon award through September 30,2008 Estimated Amount: $106,700.00 
with 2, 1 year options to extend annually I 

B. Elevator Maintenance for Parking Garages WEE EMR Elevator, Inc. 
A495-OX-VF Entire Bid 
Upon award through September 30,2012 Estimated Amount: $29,000.00 annually 

C. Emergency Vehicle Truck Parts & Service MBE 1. TVIB 
Item: 1 

i 
I 

A770-08-JM 
Upon award through September 30,2008 2. Hall-Mark Fire Apparatus-Texas, 
with 2 , l  year options to extend L.L.C. 

Items: 2 I 

Estimated Amount: $58,000.00 
annually 

D. Arts & Crafts Supplies 
A797-07-DR 
Upon award through December 3 1,2008 
with 1 year option to extend 

E. L a w  Maintenance for Service Centers 
A1 104-08-JM 
Upon award through September 30,2008 
with 2 , l  year options to extend 

1. S & S Worldwide 
&ems: 1-13,15-19,22,24-32,34 

2. Quill Corporation 
Item: 14 

Estimated Amount: $28,000.00 
allnually 

R & R Enterprises 
' Entire Bid 
Estimated Amount: $37,980.00 annually 

RFCA 2381 
EXHIBIT I I 

. . ." -- 



Contracts procured on the basis of low qaalifving bids: 

F. Recreational Board & Table Games WE4E 
A795-07-DR 
Upon award through December 3 1,2008 
with 1 year option to extend 

Contracts procured utilizing cooperative purchasin~: 

G. Communications & Data Infrastructuxe 
A1273-08-W 
Upon award through May 9,2009 

H. Ethernet to Serial Cards for Traffic Controllers 
A1271-08-WF 
Upon award through September 30,2008 
with 2 , l  year options to extend 

I. Work Uniform Rental & Laundry Service 
A534-08-DB 
Upon award through May 3 1,2008 
with 2 , l  year options to extend 

Contracts procured utilizing best value bid purchasing: 

J. Jdtorial, Supplemental Conversion~Labos, and . MBE 
- Rigging Services at the Alamodome 

A1 188-07-JH 
December 1,2007 through September 30,201 1 
with 2, additional 2 year options to extend 

1. T.A.G. Sales, Ltd. i 
Items: 1-3,5-10,12-23,25-33,35, 
39-49,51,54,57 

2. Sports Supply Group dba BSN Sports I 

Items: 4,37 & 53 
3. S & S Worldwide 

Items: 11, 34 & 56 
4. Flaghouse, Inc. 

1 
i 

Items: 24 & 36 1 

Estimated Amount: 563,000.00 annually 1 

1. AT&T Datacom (Dm-SDD-233) 
I 

I 

2. INX, kit. (DIR-SDD-239) 
Estimated Amount: $8,000,000.00 
annually 

CDWG Government, hc. 
Entire Bid 
Estimated Amount: $250,000.00 
mual ly  

G & K Services 
Entire Bid 
Estimated Amount: $153,000.00 
annually 

Go Professional Environmental Mgt. 
Entire Bid 
Estimated Amount: $670,000.00 
annually 

RFCA 23 81 



City of Sari Antonio Date I I 101 12007 

Contract Summary Sheet Agenda Item: 2381 

Namemitie (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Black Soil A291-08-JM 

Description of Item@) and Use: 
This contract will provide the City of San Antonio Public Works Department with Top Soil and Top Dressing 
for use in backfill applications and vegetation control in curbside and sidewalk areas throughout the City. 

Total $: $106,700.00 annually 

Bid Number and Title 
Contract Period 
Method of Procurement 
Price Trend 

Black Soil A291-08-JM 
Upon award through September 30, 2008 with 2, I year options to extend. 
Competitive( 2 bids received) 
15.86% increase due to rise in fuel costs. 

Contract Info: - Formal X A n n u a i  SupporUMaintenance -Lease 

Contractor(P): Casares Sand Pit & Trucking, 21651 Hwy 16 South, Von Ormy, TX. 78073. (MLSN) 
- 

Previous Contractor(s): R & L Salinas, PO Box 737, Elmendorf TX. 781 12 (FSWN) 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

Comments: NIA 

Using Parks & Recreation Department 

Department: Public Works Department 



City of SanAntonio Bid Tabulation 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/11/2007 Page 1 

Opened: July 20,2007 

For. Annual Contract for Black Soil 

A291 -08-JM JMIat 

Casares Sand Pit 
&Trucking 

21651 Hwy 16 South 

Von Ormy, 
TX 78073 

R & L Salinas 

21481 Lamrn Road 

Elmendorf, 
TX 78112 Estimated item Description 

I 

I1 

Top Soil 

F.O.B. Plant - Price per cubic yard 

Price Total 
Delivered to jobsite within city Ilmits- 
Price per cubic yard 

Pnce Total 

Top Dressing 

F.O.B. Collection Site - Price per cubic yard 

Price Total 

Delivered to jobsite within city limits - Price per cubic 
Yad 

Price Total 

Delivery 

a 

2,400 

2,600 

3,400 

1.500 

$1 06,700.00 

$8.75 

.$21,000.00 

$12.75 

$33,150.00 

$9.50 

$32,300.00 

$13.50 

$20,250.00 

24 Hrs 

$9.00 

$21,600.00 

$14.00 

$36,400.00 

$9.75 

$33,150.00 

$14.00 

$21,000.00 

Not provided 



City of San Antonio 
Contract Summary Sheet 

Date I 1/01/2007 
Agenda Item:' 2381 

Namerrltle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Elevator Maintenance for Parking Garages A.495-08-VF 

Description of Item(@ and Use: 
This contract will provide the Downtown Operations Department's Parking Division with a licensed elevator 
contractor to provide necessary systematic and periodic service and maintenance of the elevators at the 
Marina, Houston Street, Central Library, Riverbend and St. Mary's parking garages. This service is 
necessary to maintain the safety and functionality of the elevators in accordance with the Texas Department 
of Licensing & Regulation standards of maintenance as well as ANSI regulations for elevators, dumbwaiters, 
escalators, and moving sidewalks. 

Total $: $29,000.00 annually 
Bid Number and Title Elevator Maintenance for Parking Garages A495-08-VF 
Contract Period 
Method of Procurement 
Price Trend 

Competitive (3 bids received) 
Average 9% decrease 

Contract Info: - Formal X A n n u a l  -SupportlMaintenance -Lease 

c ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ N ~ ) :  EMR Elevator, Inc., 2805 W. Arkansas Rd. # l o l l  Arlington, TX 76016 (FLWN) 

Previous Contractor(s): Schindler Elevator Inc., 121 lnterpark Blvd., Ste. 1201 San Antonio, TX (MLWN) 
Automatic Elevator, PO Box 533, 7975 Ninth Street, Somerset, TX 78069 (FSWN) 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

Comments: NIA 

Using Downtown Operations 
Department: 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Prepared by Purchasing iO/Q/2007 Page 1 

Opened: September 7.2007 

For: Annual Contract lor Bevator Maintenance for Parking 
Garages 

A49MRVF 

Descrlptlon 

Kone, Inc. 

12017 Stamst Dr. 

San Antonio 
TX 78247 

EMRBlevator, Inc. 

2805 W. Arkansas Rd., 
#I01 
Arlington TX 7601 6 
817-701-2400 

Eat. Annual 
Quantltles 

$600.00 
$7,200.00 

$205.00 
$2,460.00 

$000.00 
$10,800.00 

$206.00 
$2,480.00 

$750.00 
$8,000.00 

$85.00 
$3,615.00 

Automatlc Elevator 

PO Box 533,7975 Ninth 
Street 
Somerset, 
TX 78069 

A 

B 

C 

D 

E 

F 

G 

Estimated 

Rlvetbend Parklng Garage 
Prlce per month (Total for 2 ea. Elevators) 
Total price 

Marina Parking Oarage 
Price per month (Total for 1 ea. Elevator) 
Total price 

Houston Street Parklng Garage 
Prlce per month (Total for 3 ea. Elevators) 
Total price 

Deleted 

Central Ubrary Parking Garage 
Price per month (Total for 1 ra. Elevator) 
Total pice 

St. Mary's S h t  Parking Garage 
Price per month (lotal for 3 ea.,Elevators) 
Total price 

Outside Prime-Time All Locations 
Price (perlhour) 
Total price 

Annual Amount 

12 

12 

12 

12 

12 

37 

$445.00 
$6.340.00 

$180.OC 
$2.160.00 

$725.00 
$8,700.0C 

$155.00 
$1,810.00 

$6B5.0C 
$7,020.00 

$110.00 
$4.070.00 - 

$680.00 
$8,160.00 

5340.00 
$4,080.00 

, $1,020.00 
$12.240.00 

$340.00 
$4.080.00 

$1,020.00 
$12,240.00 

$180.00 
$7,030.00 

$28.1 50.00 



City of San Antonio 
Contract Summary Sheet 

Date 1 1 /01/2007 
Agenda Item: 2381 

NamerrDtle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Emergency Vehicle Truck Parts & Service A770-08-JM 

Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide the San Antonio Fire Department with replacement parts and service for 
ambulances and firefighting apparatus. 

Total $: $58,000.00 annually 

Bid Number and Title 
Contract Period 

Emergency Vehicle Truck Parts & Service A770-08-JM 
Upon award through September 30, 2008 with 2, 1 year options to extend. 

Method of Procurement em 
Price Trend 7.50% decrease for parts, 21.5% increases in labor due to rise in market 

labor wage. 

Contract Info: - Formal XAnnua l  SupportlMaintenance -Lease 
- - 

Contractor(s): Item #I. TVlB, 2897 NE Loop 41 0 #2, San Antonio TX 7821 8, (MLSY) 
Item#2. Hall-Mark Fire Apparatus-Texas, L.L.C., 1590 East Hwy 121 Business, Suite 500, 
Lawisville, TX 75056, (MLWN) 

Previous Contractor(s): Dooley Tackaberry (MLWN) & TVlB (MLSY) - 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

Comments: NIA 

Using San Antonio Fire Department 
Department: 





City of San Antonio 

Contract Summary Sheet 
Date 1 1 101 12007 
Agenda Item: 2381 

NamelTitle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Arts & Crafts Supplies A797-07 DR 

Description of Itern(s) and Use: 
This contract will furnish arts and crafts supplies for approximately 12,000 children attending the Parks & 
Recreation Year-round Community Centers and Summer Recreation programs. Parks and Recreation has 
approximately 44 Summer Recreation Sites and 27 Year-round Community Centers. 

Total $: $28,000.00 annually 
Bid Number and Title 
Contract Period 
Method of Procurement 
Price Trend 

Arts & Crafts Supplies A797-07 DR 
Upon award through December 31,2008; with 1 year option to extend 
Competitive (3 bids received) 
4% Increase due to the rising costs of raw materials such as paper, plastic 
and wax which are used in the construction of the products 

Contract Info: - Formal X A n n u a l  SupportlMaintenance -Lease 

Contractor(s): S & S Worldwide, 75 Mill Street, Colchester, CT. 06415 ( M S W  
(Items 1-1 3, 15-19, 22, 24-32, 34) 
Quill Corporation, 100 Schelter Rd., Lincolnshire, IL. 60069 (MLWN) 
(Item 14) 

Previous Contractor(s): S&S Worldwide, 75 Mill St., Cholchester, CT 06415 (MSWN) 
Dick Blick, P.O. Box 1267, Galesburg, IL 61402 (MLWN) 
Sax Arts & Crafts, P.O. Box 51 071 0, New Berlin, WI 531 51 (MLWN) 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

_Comments: NIA 

Using Parks & Recreation 
Department: 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Arts & cmm 8wlles 

SES JE886 (486 mll 

*Prepared by Purchasing 10/1212007 Page I 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Prepared by Purchasing 10112/2007 

Arb & Cmlts Sqpllea 

Price per pa& 
Tohl Prks 
Brand b Modal 

5700SF121 

13 Glum Pump, lor gellon glum wnlalnao, SAXa3lO. 72 ma 
8022 

Price Each No Bld 
TPtPl Price 
Bmnd b Mcdel 

11 Sohool Glum. GHbn 8W, Cana of 4 gallons, SAX 38 clnrs 
#31&2808 or equal 
Prim per E B ~ B  No Bld 
Tots1 Prim 
Bmnd & ModDl 

15 Roll of papsr, KOL. Roll, 12"XzOU, SgS#RME 89 sa 
PE778 

No Bld 
T P U I P b  

16 

17 

I 8  

19 

20 

Bmnd M&l 

Hot Olue BUckr, 9 lB"  dimrmnr, pack of M 
S&S WRMEGLPI or aqua1 

Prles per pack 
Totnl Price 
!&and 8 Model ' 

Pipe Cleaner. (Chsnlls Stems), Y= thkk 
package of 100, asst urlors, BkX#748-0016 or 
.qml 
Prim per Pnnk 
Total Prlca 
Brand & Modsl 

WI~gIe Eyoa, paal and rbk, 25 u of 1111 lDas 
of7rnrn. lam, 12mm and ISrnrn, I W  IDUI par 
p c k ,  VhlIn on back, SU(#74&8505 or equal 
Prim Per Paok 
Total Prim 
Brnnd a Modal 

Acllvlly KlkMankmaklnp lndudw 24 mark 
beads, buttonr. aalno, Sraue paper, BE. 
Prka per kit 
Total Pdce 
Bmnd & Model 

DELETED 

71 pack 

4 0  P c M  

440 pew 

54 kits 

51.48 
8102.85 

888 GL521 

50.76 
$330.00 

6&6 CCBB7 

'8.418152.09 
6183.82 

SaS TR217 (88 packs] 

$1120 
58a4.80 

Sas A P l T  

No Bid 

No Bld 

No Bld 

No Bid 

No Qld 

No Bld 

No Bid 

No Blrl 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

opmmd: JunO 26,2007 ws w c r l h h  adu Corporpllon Cornmrclml Art Supply 
OW. C.A.B. Indurwr, 
Inc. 

FW: A* & crsm SUpPIbS 75 MIII s~mmt I W  Scheltsr Rd. 836 Erie Blvd East 

A7B7-07 OR DWaVsc Colchrtsr, Lincolnshlra. Syracuse, 
CT 08416 IL BOOB9 NY 13210 
800-842-7354 800-834-4808 

item ~ascnpt ion cluantity 
21 DELETED 

22 ~cUvlty Klt - Fmms Deaantlng - 48 ur t  frbrnba, 94 packs 
- 

rsqulnr, hlnmilons6, foam shapes, foam Iettrm, 
pompoms. b u m ,  eolene umodbn ahbps 

Prlcs per fflt '839.B2418.W No Bld NO Blu 
Total Prlce $2.155.88 
Brand & Modal SWAP123 (10 

23 DELETED 

Lace. PLasL, 100 spool. 100 yprcls wch, 
assonad color6 
M a  psi Pack No Bid No Bld 
Tolsl P h  
Brmnd L Model 

LU56B N w n  color 

26 ~wlsteez Wlra Craft Kit, Plekagb or ZW, Trlarw 45 paeta 
#l00-0128 

Price per Pack No Bid No Bld 
Tots1 Prim 
Brand 4 Model 

28 Scmh Art Paper. Multi-Gdorsd, I 2  shesb per 380 paCb 
pack S& #RMGPWDO 

Prlce per Packs No 6ld No Bld 
Total Wine 
Brand & Modal 

27 Woadan Suck, hardwood, polnad for 
~ n l c h h g .  12 per pack. 818rRME-MT28 

Pficb Pbr Pbck No Bld No Bld 
Total PrlW 
Brand &Modal 

28 Foam Brushes. SMIRME-AB80, I "  

Price Par Pack 
No Bid $2.28 

Total Prim 0843.92 

Brand & Modrl JEN P B l I l 2  

28 Felt fflda Pack, S&S LRME.FA3953 E20 packs 
P h  por Pack 11.88 No Bld NO B!d 
Tnlal Pdco 81,299.80 
a r d  & Mcdel 

ShS FA3333 

90 Clothaspha, Spmp 3-ll4", S&S#RMEWMQ DO p b ~ l r ~  
Prlee Each $1.85 No Bid No Bld 
TDtPl Prka 8148.50 
Brand & Model S G  W 0 4 q  

Prepared by Purchasing 10/12/2007 Page 3 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

"Prices adjusted for comparison purposes. 

Prepared by Purchasing 1011212007 



City of San Antonio 
Contract Summary Sheet 

Date I 1101 12007 
Agenda Item: 2381 

NameITitle (Caption as shown on agenda); 
Lawn Maintenance for Service Centers A1 104-08-JM 

Description of Itern(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide the City of San Antonio Asset Management with Lawn Maintenance Services at six 
(6) Centers throughout the City. 

Total $: $37,980.00 annually 

Bid Number and Title 
Contract Period - 

Lawn Maintenance for Service'Centers A1 104-08-JM 
Upon award through September 30, 2008; with 2, 1 year options to extend. 

Method of Procurement 
10% decrease Price Trend 

Contract Info: - Formal X A n n u a l  -SupporUMaintenance -Lease 

R & R Enterprises, P.O. Box 780721, San Antonio, TX 78278 (MSWN) 

Previous Contractor(s): R & R Enterprises (MSWN) and S.F. Demolition Services (MSSN) 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

Comments: NIA 

Using Department of Asset Management 
Department: 



Opened: September 7,2007 
For: Annual Con€rad lw La*m Maintenance 

for Senrice Cenlm 
R a R EnIerprlses Cantu Cty WWide Code Green, Fmntier M n g  Green hag- GreenTree L a m  Pilgrim Travelers S.F. DernoBbn . CmWactlng, Maintenance LLC Inc. Care & Landscape and Company Senrkes 

Inc. Swkn-~s, Inc. 

A1 404-08-JM JM PO Bdx 780721 3396 Rabel Rd. 3697 Highpoht, 201 9 La Mmda 31 31 L a m  Lee 5380 W. 94Ul St, 4607 Maoey Trail BOP7 Copper Traa 719 McCauley Av. 
Fe .  102 Wav #ma Wve 

San Antonb, San Antonio, San Antonb, San Antonio, Houslon, San AntMlio, San Antonio, San Antonb, 
TX 78221 TX 78217 TX 78201 TX 78223 TX 77092 TX 78253 TX 78244 TX 78221 

1 NorthwestSewkeCenler 
Price Per Each'Mowing 

Pdce Per Each Mowhg 

Price Per Eacb M a w  



City of San Antonio Date I 110112007 

Contract Summary Sheet Agenda Item: 2381 

NamelTitle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Recreational Board & Table Games A795-07-DR 
Description of Item(s) and Use: This contract will provide board and table games for entertainment 
purposes for approximately 12,000 children attending year round recreational programs at Parks 8 
Recreation community centers. 

Total $: $63,000.00 annually 
Bid Number and Title 
Contract Period 
Method of Procurement 
Price Trend 

Recreational Board & Table Games A795-07-DR 
Upon award throuqh December 31,2008; with 1 year option to extend. 
Competitive (5 bids received) 
Slight increase of 3.5%-8%, compared to last years contract on similar 
board and table games, due mostly to reduced number of quantities 
ordered. 

Contract Info: - Formal X A n n u a l  -SupportlMaintenance -Lease 

Contnotor(~): T.A.G. Sales Ud., 41 1 Hunters Creek Dr., New Braunfels, TX. 78132, (FLWN) 
(Items: 1-3, 5-10, 12-23, 25-33, 35, 39-49, 51, 54, 57,) 
S & S Worldwide, 75 Mill St. Colchester, CT., 06415, (MLWN) 
(Items: 1 1, 34, 56,) 
Flaghouse, Inc., 601 Flaghouse Dr., Hasbrouck Heights, NJ., 07604, (MSWN) 
(Items: 24, 36) 
Sport Supply Group dba BSN Sports, PO Box 7726, Dallas, TX. 75209 (MLWN) 
(Items: 4, 37, 53, ) 

Previous Contractor($): 
T.A.G. Sales Ltd. 41 1 Hunters Creek Dr. New Braunfels, TX. 78132 (FLWN) 
Learning Zone 10531 Gulfdale San Antonio, TX. 78216 (FSSN) 
S & S Worldwide 75 Mill St. Colchester, CT. 06415 (MLWN) 
Cannon Sports Po Box 11 179 Burbank, CA. 91510 (MSWN) 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

Comments: Kamico Instructional Media was deemed (NAS) because they did not carry traditional table 
games. For each of these items the games in the Kamico Instructional Media catalog did not meet the 

, specifications offered and the vendor offering the next lowest bid was selected. 

Using ' Parks & Recreation Department 
Department: 

L 
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Clty of Sari Antonio Bld TabulaWn 



CIty d San Antedo Bid Tabulation 
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Paps7d7 
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Uedhk 
U135WarmdSprinpr 
R d  
m.TX78799 
512-1 

WIU 

8a.e 
113PJ.w 

-6imn 

Nom 

A s g m h r  
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HSSkWdrkbbhkW 
OiW4 BW-7IDRW 

No E a  

MEM 

s&SUhWde 

75mSL 

Cc&%sW,CTOBI15 
-r735l 

211.115 
ao7am 

WM14 

me45 

sptsupply~rmpdba 
eSN Sporlr 
m m x m  

D s l a r ~ ~ 7 5 2 0 0  
m.m-751 D 

WBld 

NO ml 

T A G . W U d  

D M  4 i i M ~ m w D r ) u  

kern 

49 

50 

w c r i p t k n  

14OEachSmm t Hadxn#41m 

Rar Each 
Trrlal P h  

aaod 
UDdel 

E4 EschCSI: C M m l  h-. LMKnhOemsr-. 
hia Each 
TaY Prw 
mand 

N n r ~ . T X V A 3 2  
a-$5111 

$19.48 

tWm 
m4 

&Bid 



City of Sari Antonio Date 11/01/2007 
Contract Summary Sheet Agenda Item: 2381 

Namefritle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Communications & Data Infrastructure A1273-08-WF 

Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide the City of San Antonio information Technology Services Department with 
communications equipment for several capital projects, as well as replacement of other obsolete 
communications equipment over the next two (2) fiscal years. The Capital Budget appropriated funds for 
communications i&astructure equipment for projects such as the Levis Skauss Facility, the new SAPD 
Building, the Intelligent Transportation System and the Emergency Operations Center. It is estimated that 
$16,000,000.00 will be spent over the next two (2) fiscal years. 

Total $: $8,000,000.00 annually 
Bid Number and Title Commwnications & Data Masbxcture A1 273-08-W 
Contract Period Upon award through May 9,2009 per DIR Contract 
Method of Procurement DIR Contract 
Price Trend NIA 

Contract Info: - Formal &Annual -Support/Maintenance L e a s e  

Contractor(s): AT&T Datacomm (DIR-SDD-233) 712 E. Huntland Drive, Room 137, Austin, TX 78752 
(MLTNN) 
llm, Inc. (DIR-SDD-239) Building B, Suite 120, 7600 Capital of Texas Highway, Austin, 
TX 7873 1 (MLWN) 

Previous Contractor(s): AT&T Datacomm and INX, Inc. 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

Comments: NIA 

Using Information Technology Services Department 
Department: 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 10,2007 
Annual Contract for Communications and Data 
Infrastructure 

Description 
Eauipment & Software 
Percent of Discount Offered 
Price Schedule ldentification 
Type of Price Schedule 
Date of Price Schedule 
Price Schedule Column on which Discount is 
based 

DIR 

AT&T Datacomm 
712 E. Huntland Drive, 

Room 137 
Austin, TX 78752 

512-421-5160 
INX, Inc. 

Building 6, Suite 12.0 
7600 Capital of Texas Hwy 

Austin, TX 78731 
51 2-305-971 3 

Estimated Cost 

44% 
Cisco Global US Price List 

Manufacturer 
Current Posted Pricing 

Suggested Retail I 
I 1 l~etwork Hardware I $1 1,200,000.00~ 

1 2 INetwork Software 

1 3 l ~ d s t i n ~  Replacements and Repairs I $1,600,000.00~ 

I l ~ o t a l  Equipment & Software I $1 3,600,000.00 I 
Services 
Percent of Discount Offered 
Price Schedule ldentification 
Type of Price Schedule 
Date of Price Schedule 
Price Schedule Column on which Discount is 
based 

20% 
Cisco Global US Price List 

Manufacturer 
Current Posted Pricing 

Suggested Retail I I 1 l ~e two rk i n~  Maintenance I $1,600,000.00 1 
1 2 l~echnical Services I $~OO,OOO.OO~ 

Total Services 



City of San Antonio 
Contract Summary Sheet 

Date I 1101/2007 
Agenda Item: 2381 

Namenltle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Ethernet to Serial Cards for Traffic Controllers A1271 -08-WF 

Description of Item@) and Use: 
This ordinance will provide the City of San Antonio Public Works Department and Information Technology 
Services Department with a contract for network serial-to-Ethernet cards for the Traffic Management 
System's upgrade. The serial-to-Etharnet card allows the Traffic Controller unit to be connected to the City's 
network for better manaqement of the system. 

Total $: $247,379.00 annually 
Bid Number and Title 
Contract Period 

Method of Procurement 
Price Trend 

Ethernet to Serial Cards for Trafk Controllers Al271-08-WF 
Upon award through September 30, 2008; with 2, 1 year options to extend 
through September 30, 2010, as allowed by the TCPN Contract 
TCPN Contract 
No previous purchase history - new contract 

Contract Info: - Formal XX Annual -Support/Maintenance -Lease 

Contractor(s): ' CDW GOVERNMENT, INC. (TCPN CONTRACT # R4713) 230 NORTH MILWAUKEE 
AVE., VERNON HILLS, I1 60061 (MLWN) 

Previous Contractor(s): NIA 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

Comments: 

THIS PURCHASE IS MADE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT WITH REGION 4 
OF THE COOPERATIVE PURCHASING NETWORK (TCPN) PASSED ON ORDINANCE 2007-01-1 1-0048, 
DATED 111 112007. 

Using PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT 

Department: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY SERVICES DEPARTMENT ( ITSD) 



City of San Antonio,Bid Tabulation 

TCPN 
CDW Government, Inc. 

230 North Milwaukee 
Ave. 

Vernon Hills, IL 60061 
847-371 -5000 

$247,379.0C 

$247,379.00 

v 

Opened: October 10,2007 
Annual Contract for Ethernet To Serial Cards For Traffic Controllers 

A1 271 -08 WF 

Unit 

$2,473.79 

Total Estimated Contract 

Qty 

100 

Item 

I 

Description 

Digi Connect N2X-170 Card 10 Unit Pack 

Mfg#: DGL-DC-N2S-170-S-10 

-- 



Clty of San Antonio 

Contract Summary Sheet 
- - 

Date I 1/01 12007 
Agenda Item: 2381 

Namerritle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Work Uniform Rental & Laundry Service A534-08-DB 

Description of Item@) and Use: 
This contract will provide work uniform rental and laundry services for staff of several City departments, 
primarily maintenance personnel in Fleet Maintenance & Operations, Convention, Sports and Entertainment 
Facilities, Downtown Operations, FireIEMS and operations personnel in Animal Care Services. 

These uniforms will be rented and laundered by G & K Services, utilizing the Texas BuyBoard Contract No. 
264-07 in accordance with the Interlocal Participation Agreement with the Texas Local Government 
Purchasing Cooperative Ordinance No. 97097. Texas BuyBoard is administered by the Texas Association of 
School Boards and is endorsed by the Texas Municipal League (TML). All products and services that are 
part of this cooperative have been competitively bid and awarded by the Cooperative's Board of Trustees 
based on Texas Statutes. 

Total $: $1 53,000.00 annually 

Bid Number and Title 
Contract Period 
Method of Procurement 
Price Trend 

Work Uniform Rental & Laundry Service A534-08-DB 
Upon award through May 31, 2008; with 2, 1 year options to extend. 
Texas BuyBoard Contract No. 264-07 
Item I-8a: 18.9% increase in prices 
ltem 9-14: New items for Animal Care Services. 
Increased prices are due to the rise in fuel prices in the last 2 years. 

Contract Info: - Formal X A n n u a l  -SupporUMaintenance L e a s e  

Contractor(s): G&K Services, 410 Probandt, San Antonio, TX 78204 (MLWN) 

Previous Contractor(s): Cintas Corporation, P.O. Box 200147, San Antonio, TX 78220 (MLWN) 

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions: NIA 

Comments: NIA 

Using Various City Departments 
Department: 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Prepared by Purchasing 1011 612007 Page I 

C&K Senrtces 

41 o Pmbandt 

San Antonio, 
TX 78204 

Red K8p I SPl4 
$1.60 

$1 1.793.60 
$1 0.00 

Opened: October 11,2007 

For: Annual Contract for Work Unfform Rental & Laundry SerVlCe 

~ ~ 3 4 - 0 8  DB 

06/36 PolyesterlCotton LonpSleevr Shirt 
Size: (Long) L - BXL 

Slze: (Rag) S - 6XL 
Brand Nama I Style # 

Replacement cost per item 

Size: (Long) M - 6XL 
Brand Name I Style # 
Cost per Employee per Week 

Brand Name l Style # 
Cost per Employee per Week 

I 

Estimated # 
of Employees 

128 

Item 

1 

la. 

She: (Long) S - 6XL 

Description - -  
Men'e Work Unlfonns 
Men's Work Uniform (5 unlfons per week) 
85/35 PolyestarICotton Long-Sleeve Shirt 
Size: (Reg) S - 6XL 
Brand Name 1 Style # 
Cost per Employee per Week 
Total (52 weeks) 
Replacement cost par item 

Men's Work Unlforrn (5 uniforms per week) 
65/35 PolyesterlCotton Long-Sleeve Shirt 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 11.2007 

For: Annual Contract for Work ~nlform Rental & Laundry Service 

IA634-08 DE (410 Probandt I 
San Antonb, Estimated # 

of Employees 
ltem 

. . -, , , - . , - - . -. . . - . . . . . . . . 
85/35 Polyester I Cotton short-~1eev.e Shlrt 

' 

Sire: S -4XL 
Brand Name I Style # 
Cost per Employee per Week * 

Total (52 weeks) 
Replacement cost 

Description 

II 1 3a. I~ornmn's Work Uniform (5 uniforms ver week) I II 

4 

Men's Executive Uniform (5 unlforrns per week) 
60140 Polyester I CDtton Short-Sleeve Shlrt 
Size: Neck: 14 112- 191R 
Brand Name I Style # 
Cost per Employee per Week 
f otal (52 weeks) 
Replacement cost 

Women's Work Unlform (5 unlforrns per week) 
65/35 PolyesterlCatton Pants 
Slze: 4 - 32 
Brand Name I Siyle # 
Cost per Employee per Week 
Total (52 weeks) 
Replacement cost 

6 
Men's Executlve Uniforms 
Men's Executlve Unbrm (5 uniforms per week) 
60140 Polyester I Cotton Lon~Sleeve Shirt 
Size: Neck: 16 - 19112; Sleeve: 33" - 36" 
Brand Name I Style # 
Cost per Employee per Week 
Total (52 weeks) 
Replacement wst 

Rolllng Rack - 6 f a t  
Cost per Week 
Replaaemsnt Cost 

8 Men's Executlve Unlform (5 uniforms per week) 
66135 PolyesterlCotton Pants 
Size: 28-50 
Brand Name I Style # 
Cost per Employee per Week 
Total (52 weeks) 
Replacement cost 

7a. 

Red Kap I SP23 
$1.80 

$5,054.40 
$1 0.00 

Rollinp Rack - 8 foot 
Cost per Week 
Replacement Cost 

8 

Red Kap I PT59 
$1.80 

$5,054.40 
$12.00 

Red Kap I SL50 
$2.25 

$3,042.00 
514.00 

Stationary Rack - 6 foot 
Cost per Week 
Replacement Cost 

Red Kap I SL50 
52.25 

$3.042.00 
$14.00 

Red Kap I PT36 
$3.26 

$4,304.00 
$10.00 

I 

No Charge 
$0.00 

No Charge 
00.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/1612007 Page 2 

Ba. Stationaly Rack - 8 foot 
Cost per Week 
Replacement Cost 

No Charge 
$0.00 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

GK Teamwrar 

Replacement cost per Item 

-GK Team Wear 

Prepared by Purchasing 1011~12007 Page 3 
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I 

I 

City of San Antonio Date IIIOII~OO~ 

Contract Summary Sheet Agenda Item: 2381 I 
I 
I 
I 

I 
I 

I 
I 
I 

- --- -. - - 

NameRltle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Janitorial, Supplemental ConversionILabor, and Rigging Services at the Alamodome A1 188-07-JH 

Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide the Convention, Sports and Entertainment Department with a contractor to furnish 
the labor, materials and equipment for Janitorial, Supplemental ConversionlLabor, and Rigging Services at 
the Alamodome. These services are needed to maintain the facilities on a daily and event basis. 

These services have been outsourced since September 4, 1997, authorized on ordinance #86560 in order to 
help offset significant workers compensation claims expense and administrative costs associated with the 
operation and management with City staff. 

Total $: $670,000.00 annually 

Bid Number and Title 

Contract Period 

Method of Procurement 
Price Trend 

Janitorial, Supplemental ConversionILabor, and Rigging Services at the 
Alamodome A1 188-07-JH 
December 1,2007 through November 30,201 1 with 2 , 2  year options to 
extend. 
Best Value Bid (6 bids received) 
This is a' new contract with a different scope of work than currently 
receiving. The new rates overall reflect an estimated 1 % decrease for 
similar type work. 

Contract Info: - Formal X-Annual SupportlMaintenance -Lease 

~ ~ ~ t ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ( ~ ) :  Go Professional Environmental Mgt. 1400 West Ave San Antonio, Tx. 78201 (MLSN) 

Previous Contractor(s): Go Professional Environmental Mgt. 1400 West Ave San Antonio, Tx. 78201 
(MLSN) 

Comments: NIA ' 

Using Convention, Sports and Entertainment Department 
Department: 



- - - - - - .  - 

Best Valve Bid AlI86-07JH 
I Janitorial, Supplemental C o n y e c g ~ b w ,  and Rigging S e ~ c e s  At The Alamcdorne 
I 

I 

I 

i 
I 

I 
i 
! 

I 
I 

! 
! 
1 

i I 
i I 
1 
! 
i 
1 

Purchasing Contract Services 
10110107 

D 

E 

contractor Service Equipment 

SBEDA 

fiotal Potnts 

5 

20 

100 

200  

9.70 

69.00 

3.00 

11.00 

76.50 

1.00 

8.00 

58.50 

0.00 I 5.W 

9.50 0.00 

4.00 

11.00 

38.90 I 41.80 42.90 


